

December 9, 2019

Via Email

Christiaan Mader

**RE: Public Records Request, Oats & Marino Invoices re LUS Fiber Transactions
OFN: 4850-300a**

Dear Mr. Mader:

On November 22, 2019, you issued a public records request to Lafayette Consolidated Government for all invoices from Oats & Marino for any client matter related to the ongoing internal review(s) referenced by Mayor-President Joel Robideaux in an October 11 press release titled "Robideaux Makes Temporary Leadership Changes at LUS and LUS Fiber."

Enclosed please find documents responsive to your request. Please be advised information has been redacted as it is protected pursuant to the attorney client privilege. Should you need anything further, please don't hesitate to contact us.

With kind regards, we remain

Very truly yours,

OATS & MARINO
A Partnership of Professional Corporations



Cearley W. Fontenot

CWF/lan
Enclosures



ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
A PARTNERSHIP OF PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS

Suite 400, Gordon Square
100 East Vermilion Street
Lafayette, Louisiana 70501
Telephone: 337.233.1100
Facsimile: 337.233.1178

June 14, 2019

Client/Matter #: [REDACTED]
Invoice #: [REDACTED]
Tax ID #: 72-1075517

Paul D. Escott
P.O. Box 3089
600 Jefferson Street, Ste. 1000
Lafayette, LA 70502

Lafayette Consolidated Government [REDACTED]

Professional Services

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
5/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	3.30	\$577.50
5/20/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Text conversation with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
5/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	0.30	\$52.50
5/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.60	\$105.00

		[REDACTED] [REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED];		
5/22/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Attend [REDACTED]	4.00	\$700.00
5/23/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
5/23/2019	SJO	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
5/24/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
5/29/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
5/31/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
5/31/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
			<hr/> 12.40	<hr/> \$2,170.00

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE

\$2,170.00

Staff Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Lawrence E Marino	3.60	\$175.00	\$630.00
Stephen J Oats	8.80	\$175.00	\$1,540.00
Previous Account Balance			\$159.00
6/10/2019	Payment	268440	\$-159.00
Total Payments and Credits			\$-159.00
Total Account Balance			<u><u>\$2,170.00</u></u>



ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
A PARTNERSHIP OF PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS

Suite 400, Gordon Square
100 East Vermilion Street
Lafayette, Louisiana 70501
Telephone: 337.233.1100
Facsimile: 337.233.1178

August 14, 2019

Client/Matter #: [REDACTED]
Invoice #:
Tax ID #: 72-1075517

Jeffrey B. Stewart
LUS
1314 Walker Road
Lafayette, LA 70506

Lafayette Consolidated Government [REDACTED]

Professional Services

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6/04/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend telephone conference [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	0.50	\$87.50
6/11/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] File [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	4.20	\$735.00
6/11/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
6/14/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] Email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	\$36.00
6/14/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
6/14/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.70	\$472.50

		[REDACTED] [REDACTED]; Interview [REDACTED];		
6/14/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Begin drafting [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review regarding [REDACTED]	1.10	\$192.50
6/14/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review regarding [REDACTED];	0.20	\$35.00
6/14/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/14/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
6/14/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend meeting with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.00	\$350.00
6/15/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review regarding [REDACTED]	2.10	\$367.50
6/16/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Insert [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.20	\$210.00
6/17/2019	CMM	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED]	5.50	\$495.00
6/17/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$27.00
6/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] for [REDACTED]	0.60	\$105.00
6/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	0.20	\$35.00

6/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
6/17/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/17/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/17/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	1.00	\$175.00
6/18/2019	CMM	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED]	3.00	\$270.00
6/18/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
6/18/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
6/19/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/20/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Direct [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
6/20/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.00	\$350.00
6/20/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00

6/21/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	3.30	\$297.00
6/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
6/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	No Charge
6/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
6/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/21/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.30	\$227.50
6/24/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Complete [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$90.00
6/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
6/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
6/24/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Plan [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
6/25/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	1.40	\$245.00
6/25/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00

6/25/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
6/25/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Various [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
6/26/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/26/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.80	\$140.00
6/26/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
6/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
6/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and meet with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
6/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare email correspondence to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] Prepare email to [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00

6/27/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED];	0.30	\$52.50
6/27/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/28/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Conferences with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.10	\$367.50
6/28/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
6/28/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.50	\$437.50
6/28/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	0.50	\$87.50
6/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Analyze [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.90	\$157.50
			59.70	\$9,247.50

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE

\$9,247.50

Staff Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Fees
Cecile M Mouton	8.50	\$90.00	\$765.00
Lauren A Nevitt	5.00	\$90.00	\$450.00
Lawrence E Marino	20.80	\$175.00	\$3,640.00
Stephen J Oats	25.10	\$175.00	\$4,392.50
Stephen J Oats	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00

Previous Account Balance

\$2,170.00

8/05/2019	Payment	272883	\$-2,170.00
-----------	---------	--------	-------------

Total Payments and Credits

\$-2,170.00

Total Account Balance

\$9,247.50



ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
A PARTNERSHIP OF PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS

Suite 400, Gordon Square
100 East Vermilion Street
Lafayette, Louisiana 70501
Telephone: 337.233.1100
Facsimile: 337.233.1178

August 14, 2019

Client/Matter #: [REDACTED]
Invoice #:
Tax ID #: 72-1075517

Jeffrey B. Stewart
LUS
1314 Walker Road
Lafayette, LA 70506

Lafayette Consolidated Government [REDACTED]

Professional Services

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/01/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/01/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Meeting with [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	1.00	\$90.00
7/02/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	1.00	\$90.00
7/02/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review and consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.80	\$140.00
7/02/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Conferences with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.10	\$192.50

7/02/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/02/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Incorporate [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	3.00	\$525.00
7/02/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and meet with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50

7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] Draft emails [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	2.70	\$472.50
7/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
7/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50

7/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Review notes and file materials [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/05/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Telephone conferences with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
7/05/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Follow-up telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/05/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.00	\$350.00
7/07/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.10	\$192.50
7/07/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft emails to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
7/07/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/07/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Extended telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.00	\$350.00
7/08/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50

7/08/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.70	\$122.50
7/08/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/08/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/08/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/08/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	3.00	\$525.00
7/09/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
7/10/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/10/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	1.20	\$210.00
7/10/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.60	\$280.00
7/10/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00

		[REDACTED]		
		[REDACTED]		
		[REDACTED]		
7/10/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	No Charge
7/10/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of email of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/11/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	5.40	\$486.00
7/11/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.40	\$245.00
7/11/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	0.60	\$105.00
7/11/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
7/11/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.30	\$227.50
7/12/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
7/12/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00

		[REDACTED]		
7/12/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	3.40	\$595.00
7/12/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/14/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	2.10	\$367.50
7/16/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] Email conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/16/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/16/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Plan for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/19/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
7/19/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/21/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.10	\$192.50

7/21/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] Draft email [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
7/22/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/22/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/23/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
7/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	1.80	\$315.00
7/24/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Extended telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/24/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
7/25/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Prepare for and attend telephone conference with [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/26/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED];	1.50	\$262.50
7/29/2019	SJO	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50

[REDACTED]
 [REDACTED]
 [REDACTED]

7/30/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Gather [REDACTED]	0.50	\$45.00
7/30/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Reviewed [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/30/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Continue reviewing [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Considering [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
7/31/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00

71.10 \$11,718.50

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE

\$11,718.50

Staff Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Lauren A Nevitt	7.90	\$90.00	\$711.00
Lawrence E Marino	31.20	\$175.00	\$5,460.00
Stephen J Oats	31.70	\$175.00	\$5,547.50
Stephen J Oats	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00

Previous Account Balance

\$9,247.50

Total Account Balance

\$20,966.00



ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
A PARTNERSHIP OF PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS

Suite 400, Gordon Square
100 East Vermilion Street
Lafayette, Louisiana 70501
Telephone: 337.233.1100
Facsimile: 337.233.1178

September 13, 2019

Client/Matter #: [REDACTED]
Invoice #:
Tax ID #: 72-1075517

Jeffrey B. Stewart
LUS
1314 Walker Road
Lafayette, LA 70506

Lafayette Consolidated Government [REDACTED]

Professional Services

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
8/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	3.50	\$612.50
8/02/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/05/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/05/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
8/05/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Meeting with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	6.50	\$1,137.50

		[REDACTED] Analyze [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]		
8/06/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Receipt and review [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/07/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/07/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Various texts to and from [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	\$17.50
8/07/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
8/07/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
8/16/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
8/19/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/22/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider and outline [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Email conferences with [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/23/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
8/23/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Email conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00

8/26/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$27.00
8/26/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] File review regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$45.00
8/26/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
8/27/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Evaluate [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Telephone conferences with [REDACTED]	3.00	\$270.00
8/27/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider and direct [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Determine [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.70	\$122.50
8/27/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Revise and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Revise [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
8/27/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.30	\$227.50
8/28/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$18.00
8/30/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Review email from [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	\$9.00
8/30/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Initial review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$135.00
8/30/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Determine [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00



ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
A PARTNERSHIP OF PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS

Suite 400, Gordon Square
100 East Vermilion Street
Lafayette, Louisiana 70501
Telephone: 337.233.1100
Facsimile: 337.233.1178

October 15, 2019

Client/Matter #: [REDACTED]
Invoice #:
Tax ID #: 72-1075517

Lowell Duhon
Interim Director LUS
LUS
1314 Walker Road
Lafayette, LA 70506

Lafayette Consolidated Government [REDACTED]

Professional Services

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED]	1.10	\$192.50
9/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Determine [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
9/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Preliminary review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.60	\$105.00
9/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Strategy session regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Prepare for [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
9/03/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Brief [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00
9/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
9/03/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED]	1.00	\$175.00

		[REDACTED]		
9/09/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Email and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$27.00
9/09/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Review email from [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	\$9.00
9/09/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
9/09/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
9/12/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Review email from [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	\$9.00
9/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
9/24/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.75	\$131.25
9/25/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	6.60	\$594.00
9/25/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
9/25/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action regarding [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
9/25/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50

9/26/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	4.00	\$360.00
9/26/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Direct action [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
9/27/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	1.50	\$135.00
9/30/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.50	\$225.00
			24.75	\$3,047.75

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE

\$3,047.75

Staff Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Lauren A Nevitt	15.10	\$90.00	\$1,359.00
Lawrence E Marino	5.80	\$175.00	\$1,015.00
Stephen J Oats	3.85	\$175.00	\$673.75

Previous Account Balance

\$24,637.50

Total Account Balance

\$27,685.25



ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
A PARTNERSHIP OF PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS

Suite 400, Gordon Square
100 East Vermilion Street
Lafayette, Louisiana 70501
Telephone: 337.233.1100
Facsimile: 337.233.1178

November 15, 2019

Client/Matter #: [REDACTED]
Invoice #: 53139
Tax ID #: 72-1075517

Lowell Duhon
Interim Director, LUS
P.O. Box 4017-C
705 West University Ave.
Lafayette, LA 70502

Lafayette Consolidated Government [REDACTED]

Professional Services

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/01/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED]	2.70	\$243.00
10/02/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED]	4.70	\$423.00
10/03/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED]	1.40	\$126.00
10/04/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED]	4.00	\$360.00
10/07/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
10/08/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Continue [REDACTED]	2.50	\$225.00
10/10/2019	SJO	[REDACTED] Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
10/14/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	1.20	\$210.00

		[REDACTED]		
10/14/2019	SJO	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
10/15/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft correspondence to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$45.00
10/15/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$135.00
10/15/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.70	\$297.50
10/15/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review and edit [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
10/15/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Email conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
10/15/2019	SJO	Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	\$262.50
10/16/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Finalize [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$18.00
10/16/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$18.00
10/16/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Email conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.60	\$54.00

10/17/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
10/18/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	0.30	\$52.50
10/18/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	0.50	\$87.50
10/21/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
10/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Email conferences with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
10/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.90	\$157.50
10/24/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Email conferences with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
10/29/2019	LAN	[REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.50	\$45.00

		[REDACTED] [REDACTED] Telephone conference [REDACTED]		
10/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] File [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.20	\$210.00
10/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File [REDACTED]	2.70	\$472.50
10/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.60	\$105.00
10/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Review and consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	\$70.00
10/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for and telephone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] File review [REDACTED] Outline [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
10/29/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Consider [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	\$35.00
10/30/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Direct [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review [REDACTED] Compare to [REDACTED] Identify and consider [REDACTED]	0.60	\$105.00
10/30/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Prepare for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.70	\$472.50
10/31/2019	LEM	[REDACTED] Email conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Email conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Continue	0.90	\$157.50

	[REDACTED]		
10/31/2019	LEM [REDACTED] Interview [REDACTED]	3.70	\$647.50
10/31/2019	LEM [REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.50	\$87.50
		<hr/>	<hr/>
		41.40	\$5,647.00

Additional Charges:

10/05/2019	16 GB USB Flash Drive;		<hr/>
10/16/2019	Postage 2 @ .50;		\$3.10
			\$1.00
			<hr/>
		Total Expenses	\$4.10

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE **\$5,651.10**

Staff Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Lauren A Nevitt	18.80	\$90.00	\$1,692.00
Lawrence E Marino	20.20	\$175.00	\$3,535.00
Stephen J Oats	2.40	\$175.00	\$420.00

Previous Account Balance **\$27,685.25**

Total Account Balance **\$33,336.35**